O Capital Region
O‘ Council of Governments

2018-19 CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS RESULTS - Ratified 3/19/18
Contract Term — April 1, 2018 to March 31, 2019

Blue shading indicates successful vendor.

PIPE
ADS Chemung
Description DEL FOB DEL FOB
12” SLCPP (HDPE) — TOTAL 250 LF 4.62 4.46 NO BID NO BID
15” SLCPP (HDPE) - TOTAL 1,840 LF 6.50 6.25 NO BID NO BID
18” SLCPP (HDPE) - TOTAL 2,815 LF 8.80 8.50 NO BID NO BID
24" SLCPP (HDPE) — TOTAL 976 LF 15.10 14.45 NO BID NO BID
30” SLCPP (HDPE) TOTAL 144 LF 21.49 20.42 NO BID NO BID
36” SLCPP (HDPE) TOTAL 200 LF 23.75 22.55 NO BID NO BID
48” SLCPP (HDPE) TOTAL 40 vLF 45.10 43.56 NO BID NO BID
4” DOT GRADE PERFORATED PIPE (UNDER DRAIN) — 44.00 42.00 NO BID NO BID
TOTAL 27 COILS per 100 ft per 100 ft
6” DOT GRADE PERFORATED PIPE (UNDER DRAIN) 112.00 107.00 NO BID NO BID
TOTAL 7 COILS per 100 ft per 100 ft
12” CMP - TOTAL 75 LF NO BID NO BID 12.00 12.00
15” CMP - TOTAL 95 LF NO BID NO BID 15.00 15.00
18” CMP — TOTAL 95 LF NO BID NO BID 18.00 18.00
24” ADS PIPE — TOTAL 240 LF 15.10 14.45 22.00 22.00
STORMWATER BOXES
ADS Chemung
Description FOB DEL FOB DEL
2’'X4’ STANDARD BOX- 24” DEEP — TOTAL 32 BOXES NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2’X4’ STANDARD BOX- 30” DEEP TOTAL 39 BOXES NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2’'X4’ STANDARD BOX- 36” DEEP TOTAL 32 BOXES NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2’'X6’ STANDARD BOX- 36” DEEP TOTAL 1 BOXES NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TYPE-M INLET TOP W/O GRATE — TOTAL 26 TOPS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TYPE-M INLET TOP 8” — TOTAL 27 TOPS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TYPE-C INLET TOP 6” REVEAL W/O GRATE TOTAL 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TOPS
TYPE-C INLET TOP 8” REVEAL W/O GRATE TOTAL 4 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TOPS
TYPE-C INLET TOP 10” REVEAL W/O GRATE TOTAL 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TOPS
TYPE C INLET TOP 8” REVEAL TOTAL 17 TOPS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
STANDARD GRATE FRAME 2’X4’ TOTAL 22 FRAMES NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BICYCLE-SAFE GRATE 2'X4’ — TOTAL 52 GRATES NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
STANDARD GRATE 2'X4’ — TOTAL 8 GRATES NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID




MANHOLE CASTINGS & RISERS

ADS Chemung
Description FOB DEL FOB DEL
2” SLOTTED MANHOLE RISERS — TOTAL5 RISERS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3” SLOTTED MANHOLE RISERS — TOTAL 5 RISERS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4” SLOTTED MANHOLE RISERS — TOTAL 5 RISERS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2” METAL RISERS — TOTAL 12 RISERS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2” —2'x 4’ CONCRETE RISER — TOTAL 19 RISERS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4” —2’x 4 CONCRETE RISER — TOTAL 19 RISERS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
6” —2'x 4 CONCRETE RISER — TOTAL 16 RISERS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
8” —2'x 4’ CONCRETE RISER — TOTAL 9 RISERS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12” —2’x 4 CONCRETE RISER — TOTAL 1 RISERS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
GUIDE RAILS
ALL STEEL PRODUCTS SHALL MEET THE PA STEEL PROCUREMENT ACT.
ADS Chemung
Description FOB DEL FOB DEL
Type 25 - TOTAL 500 NO BID NO BID 21.00 21.00
Type 25 —TOTAL 287.5 LF NO BID NO BID 21.00 21.00
Terminal End Sections — TOTAL 8 LF NO BID NO BID 900.00 900.00
Type 2S Radius — TOTAL 75 LF NO BID NO BID 28.00 28.00
Reset Ex. Type 2S — TOTAL 762.5 LF NO BID NO BID 19.50 19.50
Contact Information
Advanced Drainage Systems, Inc. (ADS) Chemung Supply Corp.

4640 Trueman Boulevard
Hilliard OH, 43026

Vincent O’Brien
717-475-9421
Vincent.obrien@ads-pipe.com

2420 Corning Road, PO Box 527

Elmira, NY 14902

John Shuck
814-386-2973

shuck@chemungsupply.com




