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CAPCOG 2017-18 ARMITAGE GOLF COURSE BIDS Ratified 3/19/18 
Ordering information is at the end of the document 

Contract Term – April 1, 2017 to March 31, 2018 
 

CAPCOM ARMITAGE GOLF COURSE BID -  CROP PRODUCTION SERVICES 

      

Quantity Unit Description Size Price 
Extended 

Price 

5 Gal Banol: Quoted Proplant 1 Gallon $298.00 $1,490.00 

10 Gal Chipco 26 Gt 2X2.5 Case $573.75 $1,147.50 

10 Lb Compass 20X8 Oz  $3,419.80 $3,419.80 

400 Lb Daconil Ultrex 4X5 Lb Case $280.00 $5,600.00 

384 Lb Dithane T/O:Rainshield  4x12 lb $213.12 $1,704.96 

4.9 Lb Emerald 0.49 Lb $156.80 $156.80 

20 Gal Enclave 2X2.5 Case $501.50 $2,006.00 

33 Lb Endorse: Quoted Affirm WDG 3X2.4 Lb  $668.88 $3,009.96 

6 Lb Heritage 1 Pound $330.00 $1,980.00 

36 Lb Honor 6X3 Lb Case $2,616.12 $5,232.24 

5 Gal Insignia 2X2.5 Case $5,795.00 $5,795.00 

336 Oz Lexicon 4X21 Oz Case $1,935.36 $7,741.44 

80 Oz Medallion WDG 4X8 Oz Case $595.20 $1,488.00 

15 Gal Oreon 2X2.5 Case $396.55 $1,189.65 

15 Gal Secure 2X2.5 Case $605.00 $1,815.00 

12 Gal Spectator: Quoting Fitness fungicide 4x1 GL Case  $275.96 $827.88 

4 Gal Subdue Maxx 1 Gallon $520.00 $2,080.00 

10 Lb Tourney 5 Lb Case $692.75 $1,385.50 

136.8 Oz Xzemplar 11.4 oz $205.20 $2,462.40 

6 Gal Acclaim Extra 1 Gallon $470.77 $2,824.62 

19 Gal Confront SC 1 Gallon $118.99 $2,260.81 

10 Gal Dimension 2EW 2X2.5 Case $1,050.00 $2,100.00 

9.1 Oz Prosedge: Quoting Sedgehammer 1.33 Oz $68.00 $476.00 

600 Lb 
Regalkade G: Quoting 0-0-7 .375% 
Evade 50# Bag $10.95 $131.40 

10 Gal 24D Amine:  2X2.5 Case $15.60 $156.00 

10 Gal RoundUp Pro: Quoting KleenUp Pro 2X2.5 Case $66.00 $132.00 

2.5 Gal Speedzone 2.5 Gal $190.00 $190.00 

100 Lb Snapshot 50# Bag $80.00 $160.00 

3600 Lb Team 2G 40# Bag $19.50 $1,755.00 

5 Gal Trimec Bent 2X2.5 Case $195.00 $195.00 

2 Qt Sonar 1 Quart $746.40 $1,492.80 

2 Gal Captan 1 Gallon N/A $0.00 

128 Oz Acelepryn 64 Oz $977.50 $1,955.00 

10 Qt Conserve Quart $110.00 $1,100.00 

5 Gal Dursban 4E: Quoted Chlorpyrifos Spec 4 2X2.5 Case $234.00 $234.00 

10 Gal Dylox 420 SL 2X2.5 Case $355.00 $710.00 
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1830 Lb Dylox 6.2 G 30# Bag $39.00 $2,318.00 

153.6 Oz Merit 75 WSP: Quoted Malice 75 WSP 4X4X1.6 Oz $80.00 $480.00 

7.5 Gal Permethrin Pro: Quoted Tengard 1.25 Gal $53.50 $160.50 

50 Oz Provaunt 12Oz $88.92 $355.68 

192 Oz Ference 96 Oz $1,668.00 $3,336.00 

80 Lb Nimitz Pro G 40 Lb $200.00 $400.00 

4 Gal Primo Maxx 
2X1 Gallon 
Case $580.00 $1,160.00 

10 Gal Proxy 2X2.5 Case $150.00 $300.00 

5 Gal Trimmit 2 SC 2X2.5 Case $2,025.00 $2,025.00 

24 Qt Cleary Tank Cleaner: Quoted All Clear 1 Gallon $40.00 $40.00 

3 Gal Cleary Defoamer: Quoted Unfoamer Quart $18.00 $216.00 

2 Gal 
Promark Foam Marker: Quoted Trecker 
Trax 2.5 Gal $65.00 $65.00 

20 Gal Duplex Wetting Agent: Quoted Mizer 2X2.5 Case $105.00 $420.00 

5 Gal Lesco Wet Plus: Quoted Respond 3 2X2.5 Case $222.00 $222.00 

40 Gal Ferromec ac: Quoted Feature AC 15-0-0 2X2.5 Case $26.00 $208.00 

1600 Lb 18-3-18, Greens Grade Fertilizer 50# Bag $35.00 $1,120.00 

12,000 Lb 
22-6-14, 60% Nutralene: Quoted 22-0-8, 
50% BCMU, 4% Fe 50# Bag $16.75 $402.00 

2200 Lb 
Naturesafe 8-3-5: Quoted 5-4-5 
Groganics 50# Bag $19.50 $858.00 

1200 Lb 20-20-20 Soluble 25# Bag $22.75 $1,092.00 

700 Lb 19-25-5 Starter Greens: Quoted 10-18-22,  50# Bag $35.00 $490.00 

10 Gal Alpha Nova 2X2.5 Case $255.00 $510.00 

600 Lb Dolomitic Lime 50# Bag $4.99 $59.88 

20 Gal 
Adams Earth Biostimulant: Quoted Riser 
FA 2X2.5 Case $90.00 $360.00 

10 Gal 0-0-26 Starphite 2X2.5 Case $60.00 $120.00 

30 Gal 
16-2-7, SRN: Quoted Maximum N-Pact 
24-0-0 2X2.5 Case $64.00 $384.00 

81.6 Lb Foltec 16-0-16 
3X13.6 Lb 
Case $198.00 $396.00 

10 Gal Micro Mix: Quoted Feature Pro 2X2.5 Case $58.00 $116.00 

100 Lb Penncross seed 25 Lb Pail $196.00 $784.00 

100 Lb Penneagle seed 25 Lb Pail $210.00 $840.00 

100 Lb Champion GQ GLS Perennial Ryegrass 50# Bag $67.50 $135.00 

1000 Lb 
Executive Turf Mix: 50% Blue, 25% Rye, 
25% Chewings Fescue 50# Bag $92.50 $18.50 

15 Gal KleenUp Pro Glyphosate 2X2.5 Case $66.00 $990.00 

2500 Lb Criterion .5G 30# Bag $21.00 $1,764.00 

25 Lb Suregurad: Quoted Sureguard SC 64 Oz $545.60 $545.60 

2500 Lb 13-0-5, 30% XCU, .15% Dimension 50# Bag $17.00 $850.00 
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ARMITAGE GOLF COURSE - HELENA 
  

      NAME OF CAPCOG MUNICIPAL OR ASSOCIATE MEMBER:  Hampden Township 
  LANDSCAPE CHEMICALS 

  

Quantity Unit Description 
Notes (ie: Delivery 

Instructions,/Specific 
Formulas) 

Alternative 
Product 

Unit Price 

5 Gal Banol Fungicide-$400.94/gal Prefer Gallon size Proplant $300.00/gal 

10 Gal Chipco GT Fungicide-$111.67/gal 
Prefer 2x2.5 Gal. 
case size Chipco 26019 $38.46/gal 

10 Lb Compass Fungicide-$338.00/lb 
Prefer 20x8 oz ws 
size     

400 Lb Daconil Ultrex Fungicide-$14.00/lb 
Prefer 4x5 Lb case 
size 

Chlorothalonil 
DF $7.25/lb 

384 Lb Dithane T/O Fungicide-$4.32/lb 
Prefer 4x12 Lb case 
size     

4.9 Lb Emerald Fungicide-$320.16/lb 
Prefer 10x0.49 Lb 
case size     

20 Gal Enclave Fungicide-$116.00/gal 2x2.5 Gal case size     

33 Lb Endorse Fungicide-$102.40/lb-Affirm 4x5lb case 3x11 Lb case size     

6 Lb Heritage Fungicide-$317.00/lb 
Prefer 1Lb 
container size Strobe $195.00/lb 

36 Lb Honor Fungicide-$145.32/lb 
Prefer 6x3 Lb case 
size     

5 Gal Insignia Fungicide-$1,159.00/gal Prefer 2x2.5 Gal size     

336 FlOz Lexicon Fungicide-$23.04/oz 4x21 Fl Oz size     

80 Oz Medallion Fungicide-$18.70/oz-4x8oz case 
Prefer 16x5 Oz case 
size     

15 Gal Oreon Fungicide-$63.45/gal 
Prefer 2x2.5 Gal 
case size     

15 Gal Secure Fungicide-$588.00/gal Prefer 2.5 Gal size     

12 Gal 
Spectator T&O Fungicide-$120.00/gal-Propiconazole 
41.8% 

Prefer 2x2.5 Gal 
case size     

4 Gal Subdue Maxx Fungicide-$520.00/gal Prefer 1 Gal size 
Mefenoxam 
2AQ $349.60/gal 

10 Lb Tourney Fungicide-$138.55/lb 5 Lb case size     

136.8 FlOz Xzemplar Fungicide-$18.00/oz 
Prefer 2x114 Fl Oz 
case     

6 Gal Acclaim Extra Herbicide-$484.00/gal 1 Galsize     

19 Gal Confront Herbicide-$118.75/gallon 1 Gal size 2D $78.19/gal 

10 Gal Dimension 2EW Herbicide-$210.00/gal 
Prefer 2x2.5 Gal 
case     

9.1 Oz Prosedge Herbicide-$50.38/0z-1.33 oz bottle 1.3 Oz bottle     

600 Lb Regalkade G Herbicide-N/A 50 lb bag     

10 Gal 2,4 - D Amine Herbicide-$35.00/gal-Hardball 
Prefer 2x2.5 Gal 
case     

10 Gal Roundup Pro Maxx Herbicide-$35.35/gal 
Prefer 2x2.S Gal 
case Ranger Pro $11.10/gal 

2.5 Gal Speedzone Herbicide-$66.80/gal 2.5 Gal size     

100 Lb Snapshot 2.5 TG Herbicide-$1.20/lb 50 Lb bag     

3600 Lb Team 2G Herbicide-$0.43/lb 40 Lb bag     

5 Gal Trimec Bent Herbicide-$36.30/gal Prefer 2x2.5 Gal size     

2 Qt Sonar As Herbicide-$810.69/qt Qt size     

2 Gal Captain Herbicide-$30.56/gal 1Gal size     

128 FlOz Acelepryn Insecticide-$15.27/oz 64 Fl Oz size     

10 Qt Conserve Insecticide-$151.36/qt Qt size     

5 Gal Dursban 4E Insecticide-$46.15/gal-Chlorpyrifos 4E 2.5 Gal size     
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10 Gal Dylox 420 SL Insecticide-$66.10/gal 2.5 Gal size     

1830 Lb Dylox 6.2 Granular Insecticide-$1.18/lb 30 Lb bag     

153.6 Oz Merit 7S WSP Insecticide-$8.77/oz 4x4xl.6 Oz case 
Criterion 
75WSP $2.60/oz 

7.5 Gal Permethrin Pro Insecticide-$54.89/gal-Astro 1.25 Gal     

50 Oz Provaunt Insecticide-$7.40/oz in 12 oz bottle 10 Oz bottle     

192 FlOz Ference Insecticide-$17.375/oz 96 Fl Oz size     

80 Lb Nimitz Pro G  Nematicide-$10.14/lb 40 Lb bucket size     

4 Gal Primo Growth Regulator-$290.00/gal 2x1 Gal case T-Nex $102.00/gal 

10 Gal Proxy Growth Regulator-$34.30/gal 5 Gal size Ethephon $24.59/gal 

5 Gal Trimmit 2 SC Growth Regulator-$405.00/gal 2.5 Gal size Tide Paclo 2SC $125.00/gal 

24 Qt Cleary Tank Cleaner Qt size 
Wipeout Tank 
Cleaner $12.00/qt 

3 Gal Clearys Defoamer Gal size Foam Buster $30.00/gal 

2 Gal Promark Foam Marker Gal size Align $43.00/gal 

20 Gal Duplex Wetting Agent 5 Gal size Injector $16.00/gal 

5 Gal Lesco Wet Plus Wetting Agent 2.5 Gal size Soaker Plus $36.00/gal 

40 Gal Ferromec AC-$8.33/gal 2x2.5 Gal size Turf Nectar $7.50/gal 

1600 Lb 18-3-18 Fertilizer with minors, greens grade, SOP 50 Lb bags 
18-9-18 
w/75% MU $0.623/lb 

12000 Lb 22-6-14 Fertilizer with 60% Nutralene,SOP, regular size 50 Lb bags- 
21-6-21 
w/60% MU $0.476/lb 

2200 Lb Nature Safe 8-3-5 Fertilizer, greens grade-$0.721/lb so Lb bags     

1200 Lb Plantex 20-20-20 Soluble Fertilizer 2S Lb bag 
Pro Sol 20-20-
20 $0.931/lb 

700 Lb Starter Fertilizer 19-25-5, greens grade, SOP SO Lb bag 
19-25-8 
w/72% MU $0.623/lb 

10 Gal Alpha Nova 2x2.5 Gal size Renova $54.00/gal 

600 Lb Granular Dolomitic Lime-$0.09/lb 50 Lb bag     

20 Gal Adams Earth Biostim. 2x2.5 Gal size Hydra Hume $13.00/gal 

10 Gal Phosphite 30,0-0-27 2x2.S Gal size Elemax 0-0-26 $16.00/gal 

30 Gal 16-2-7, 25% SRN, Mag, S, Micros 2x2.5 Gal size 
14-2-14 
w/50% SRN $14.00/gal 

81.6 Lb Foltec SG 16-0-16-N/A 13.6 Lb size     

10 Gal Micro Mix Glucoheptonate Chelate 2x2.5 Gal size 
Tracite HEP 
35 $10.00/gal 

100 Lb Penncross creeping bentgrass seed, blue tag certified 25 Lb bag-$7.50/lb     

100 Lb Penneagle creeping bentgrass seed, blue tag certified 2S Lb bag-N/A     

100 Lb Perennial Ryegrass Mix, leaf spot resistant 50 Lb bag-N/A     

1000 Lb 
High quality mix of the following turf grass seed:50% 
Kentucky blues (2),25% Creeping red fescue (1), 25% 
Perennial rye (1)-N/A 

50 Lb bag 

    

15 Gal 
Glyophosate herbicide (labeled for landscape and right 
of use) 

$11.10/gal 
    

2500 Lb Criterion O.5 Grub Control (Granular in bags) $0.68/lb     

25 Lb 
Sureguard (Pre and post emergent herbicide for control 
of weeds in landscape) Mixes with glyophosate 
(granular) 

$120.80/lb 
Semera $95.55/lb 

2SOO Lb 
13-0-5 Fertilizer with .15 dimension herbicide 
(crabgrass control) (granular) SO lbs. Bags, Greenyard 
Crabgrass Preventer or approved equal.-$0.29/lb 

13-0-5 w/25% XCU 
& .172% Dithiopyr 
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ARMITAGE GOLF COURSE - HAMPDEN TOWNSHIP 

NAME OF CAPCOG MUNICIPAL OR ASSOCIATE MEMBER: Hampden Township 

Landscape Chemicals  
 

Quantity Unit Description 
Price/Unit/ 
Delivered 

Total 
Price/ 

Delivered 
Price/Unit/ 

FOB 
Total 

Price/FOB 
Container 

size: 
Notes (ie: Delivery Instructions, Specific 

Formulas) 

5 Gal Banol Fungicide 
$                           

399.000 
$                          

1,995.00 
$                            

399.000 
$                          

1,995.00 1 gl Prefer Gallon Size 

10 Gal Chipco GT Fungicide 
$                            

114.800 
$                          

1,148.00 
$                            

114.800 
$                          

1,148.00 2.5 gl Prefer 2x2.5 Gal. Case Size 

10 Lb Compass Fungicide 
$                            

344.600 
$                          

3,446.00 
$                            

344.600 
$                          

3,446.00 10 lb Prefer 20x8 oz ws size 

400 Lb 
Daconil Ultrex 
Fungicide 

$                              
14.000 

$                          
5,600.00 

$                              
14.000 

$                          
5,600.00 5 lb Prefer4x5 Lb case size 

384 Lb 
Dithane T/O 
Fungicide 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- NA Prefer 4x12 Lb case size 

4.9 Lb Emerald Fungicide 
$                            

320.000 
$                          

1,568.00 
$                            

320.000 
$                          

1,568.00 .49 lb Prefer 10x0.49 Lb case size 

20 Gal Enclave Fungicide 
$                                       
- 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- NA 2x2.5 Gal case size 

33 Lb Endorse Fungicide 
$                              

92.900 
$                          

3,065.70 
$                              

92.900 
$                          

3,065.70 2.4 lb 3x11 Lb case size 

6 Lb Heritage Fungicide 
$                            

317.000 
$                          

1,902.00 
$                            

317.000 
$                          

1,902.00 1 lb Prefer 1 Lb container size 

36 Lb Honor Fungicide 
$                            

145.340 
$                          

5,232.24 
$                            

145.340 
$                          

5,232.24 3 lb Prefer 6x3 Lb case size 

5 Gal Insignia Fungicide 
$                        

1,159.000 
$                          

5,795.00 
$                        

1,159.000 
$                          

5,795.00 2.5 gl Prefer 2x2.5 Gal. case size 

336 
Fl 
Oz Lexicon Fungicide 

$                              
23.040 

$                          
7,741.44 

$                              
23.040 

$                          
7,741.44 21 oz 4x21 Fl oz size 

80 Oz Medallion Fungicide 
$                              

18.700 
$                          

1,496.00 
$                              

18.700 
$                          

1,496.00 8 oz Prefer 16x5 oz Case Size 

15 Gal Oreon Fungicide 
$                                       
- 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- NA Prefer 2x2.5 Gal. Case size 

  

Fisher & Son 
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Quantity Unit Description 
Price/Unit/ 
Delivered 

Total 
Price/ 

Delivered 
Price/Unit/ 

FOB 
Total 

Price/FOB 
Container 

size: 
Notes (ie: Delivery Instructions, Specific 

Formulas) 

15 Gal Secure Fungicide  
$                            

588.000 
$                          

8,820.00 
$                            

588.000 
$                          

8,820.00 2.5 gl Prefer 2.5 Gal. Size 

12 Gal 
Spectator T&O 
Fungicide  

$                              
72.000 

$                              
864.00 

$                              
72.000 

$                              
864.00 1 gl Prefer 2x2.5 Gal. Case Size 

4 Gal 
Subdue Maxx 
Fungicide 

$                            
520.000 

$                          
2,080.00 

$                            
520.000 

$                          
2,080.00 1 gl Prefer 1 Gal. Size 

10 Lb Tourney Fungicide 
$                            

138.550 
$                          

1,385.50 
$                            

138.550 
$                          

1,385.50 5 lb 5 Lb case size 

136.8 
Fl 
Oz Xzemplar Fungicide 

$                              
15.640 

$                          
2,139.55 

$                              
15.640 

$                          
2,139.55 114 fl oz Prefer 2x114 Fl oz case 

6 Gal 
Acclaim Extra 
Herbicide 

$                            
472.000 

$                          
2,832.00 

$                            
472.000 

$                          
2,832.00 1 gl 1 Gal. Size 

19 Gal Confront Herbicide 
$                            

123.500 
$                          

2,346.50 
$                            

123.500 
$                          

2,346.50 1 gl 1 Gal. Size 

10 Gal 
Dimension 2EW 
Herbicide 

$                            
210.000 

$                          
2,100.00 

$                            
210.000 

$                          
2,100.00 2.5 gl Prefer 2x2.5 Gal case 

9.1 Oz Prosedge Herbicide  
$                              

53.080 
$                              

483.03 
$                              

53.080 
$                              

483.03 1.3 oz 1.3 oz bottle 

600 Lb 
Regalkade G 
Herbicide 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- NA 50 lb bag 

10 Gal 
2,4 - D Amine 
Herbicide 

$                              
30.800 

$                              
308.00 

$                              
30.800 

$                              
308.00 2.5 gl Prefer 2x2.5 gal case 

10 Gal 
Roundup Pro Maxx 
Herbicide 

$                              
40.120 

$                              
401.20 

$                              
40.120 

$                              
401.20 1.67 gl Prefer 2x2.5 Gal case 

2.5 Gal Speedzone Herbicide 
$                              

71.600 
$                              

179.00 
$                              

71.600 
$                              

179.00 2.5 gl 2.5 Gal size 

100 Lb 
Snapshot 2.5 TG 
Herbicide 

$                                
1.380 

$                              
138.00 

$                                
1.380 

$                              
138.00 50 lb 50 lb bag 

3600 Lb Team 2G Herbicide 
$                                       
- 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- NA 40 lb bag 

5 Gal 
Trimec Bent 
Herbicide 

$                              
46.000 

$                              
230.00 

$                              
46.000 

$                              
230.00 2.5 gl Prefer 2x2.5 gal size 

2 Qt Sonar As Herbicide 
$                              

96.000 
$                              

192.00 
$                              

96.000 
$                              

192.00 Qt Qt Size 
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Quantity Unit Description 
Price/Unit/ 
Delivered 

Total 
Price/ 

Delivered 
Price/Unit/ 

FOB 
Total 

Price/FOB 
Container 

size: 
Notes (ie: Delivery Instructions, Specific 

Formulas) 

2 Gal Captain Herbicide 
$                              

35.900 
$                                

71.80 
$                              

35.900 
$                                

71.80 2.5 gl 1 Gal. Size 

128 
Fl 
Oz Acelepryn Insecticide 

$                              
15.273 

$                          
1,954.94 

$                              
15.273 

$                          
1,954.94 64 fl oz 64 Fl oz size 

10 Qt Conserve Insecticide 
$                            

113.000 
$                          

1,130.00 
$                            

113.000 
$                          

1,130.00 Qt Qt Size 

5 Gal 
Dursban 4E 
Insecticide 

$                            
118.000 

$                              
590.00 

$                            
118.000 

$                              
590.00 2.5 gl 2.5 Gal size 

10 Gal 
Dylox 420 SL 
Insecticide 

$                            
172.000 

$                          
1,720.00 

$                            
172.000 

$                          
1,720.00 2.5 gl 2.5 Gal size 

1830 Lb 
Dylox 6.2 Granular 
Insecticide 

$                                
1.300 

$                          
2,379.00 

$                                
1.300 

$                          
2,379.00 30 lb bag 30 lb bag 

153.6 Oz 
Merit 75 WSP 
Insecticide 

$                                
3.094 

$                              
475.24 

$                                
3.094 

$                              
475.24 4 x 1.6 oz 4x4x1.6 Oz case 

7.5 Gal 
Permethrin Pro 
Insecticide 

$                              
47.200 

$                              
354.00 

$                              
47.200 

$                              
354.00 1.25 gl 1.25 Gal 

50 Oz Provaunt Insecticide 
$                                

8.000 
$                              

400.00 
$                                

8.000 
$                              

400.00 12 oz 10 oz bottle 

192 
Fl 
Oz Ference Insecticide 

$                              
17.375 

$                          
3,336.00 

$                              
17.375 

$                          
3,336.00 96 fl oz 96 Fl Oz size 

80 Lb 
Nimitz Pro G 
Nematicide 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- NA 40 lb bucket size 

4 Gal 
Primo Growth 
Regulator 

$                            
290.000 

$                          
1,160.00 

$                            
290.000 

$                          
1,160.00 1 gl 2x1 Gal case 

10 Gal 
Proxy Growth 
Regulator 

$                              
34.000 

$                              
340.00 

$                              
34.000 

$                              
340.00 2.5 gl 5 Gal size 

5 Gal 
Trimmit 2 SC Growth 
Regulator 

$                            
405.000 

$                          
2,025.00 

$                            
405.000 

$                          
2,025.00 2.5 gl 2.5 Gal Size 

24 Qt Clearly Tank Cleaner 
$                                       
- 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- NA Qt Size 

3 Gal Clearys Defoamer 
$                                       
- 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- NA Gal size 

2 Gal 
Promark Foam 
Marker 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- NA Gal size 
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Quantity Unit Description 
Price/Unit/ 
Delivered 

Total 
Price/ 

Delivered 
Price/Unit/ 

FOB 
Total 

Price/FOB 
Container 

size: 
Notes (ie: Delivery Instructions, Specific 

Formulas) 

20 Gal 
Duplex Wetting 
Agent 

$                              
34.000 

$                              
680.00 

$                              
34.000 

$                              
680.00 2.5 gl 5 Gal size 

5 Gal 
Lesco Wet Plus 
Wetting Agent 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- NA 2.5 Gal size 

40 Gal Ferromec AC 
$                              

13.200 
$                              

528.00 
$                              

13.200 
$                              

528.00 2.5 gl 2x2.5 Gal Size 

1600 Lb 

18-3-18 Fertilizer 
with minors, greens 
grade, SOP 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- NA 50 lb bags 

12000 Lb 

22-6-14 Fertilizer 
with 60% Nutralene, 
SOP, Regular size 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- NA 50 lb bags 

2200 Lb 

Nature Safe 8-3-5 
Fertilizer, greens 
grade 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- NA 50 lb bags 

1200 Lb 
Plantex 20-20-20 
Soluble Fertilizer 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- NA 25 lb bags 

700 Lb 

Starter Fertilizer 19-
25-5, greens grade, 
SOP 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- NA 50 lb bags 

10 Gal Alpha Nova 
$                                       
- 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- NA 2x2.5 lb bags 

600 Lb 
Granular Dolomitic 
Lime 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- NA 50 Lb bag 

20 Gal Adams Earth Biostim 
$                                       
- 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- NA 2x2.5 Gal Size 

10 Gal Phosphite 30, 0-0-27 
$                                       
- 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- NA 2x2.5 Gal Size 

30 Gal 
16-2-7, 25% SRN, 
Mag, S, Mircos 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- NA 2x2.5 Gal Size 

81.6 Lb Foltec SG 16-0-16 
$                                       
- 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- NA 13.6 Lb size 
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Quantity Unit Description 
Price/Unit/ 
Delivered 

Total 
Price/ 

Delivered 
Price/Unit/ 

FOB 
Total 

Price/FOB 
Container 

size: 
Notes (ie: Delivery Instructions, Specific 

Formulas) 

10 Gal 

Micro Mix 
Glucopheptonate 
Chelate 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- NA 2x2.5 Gal Size 

100 Lb 

Penncross creeping 
bentgrass see, blue 
tag certified 

$                                
8.200 

$                              
820.00 

$                                
8.200 

$                              
820.00 25 lb 25 lb bag 

100 Lb 

Penneagle creeping 
bentgrass seed, blue 
tag certifiied 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- NA 25 lb bag 

100 Lb 

Perennial Ryegrass 
Mix, leaf spot 
resistant 

$                                
1.190 

$                              
119.00 

$                                
1.190 

$                              
119.00 50 lb 50 lb bag 

1000 Lb 

High quality mix of 
the following turf 
grass see: 50% 
Kentucky blues (2), 
25% Creeping red 
fescue(1), 25% 
Perennial rye (1) 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- NA 50 lb bag 

15 Gal 

Glyophosate 
herbicide (labeled 
for landscape and 
right of use) 

$                              
12.800 

$                              
192.00 

$                              
12.800 

$                              
192.00 2.5 gl   

2500 Lb 

Criterion 0.5 Grub 
Control (Granular in 
bags) 

$                                
0.690 

$                          
1,725.00 

$                                
0.690 

$                          
1,725.00 30 lb bag   
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Quantity Unit Description 
Price/Unit/ 
Delivered 

Total 
Price/ 

Delivered 
Price/Unit/ 

FOB 
Total 

Price/FOB 
Container 

size: 
Notes (ie: Delivery Instructions, Specific 

Formulas) 

25 Lb 

Sureguard (Pre and 
post emergent 
herbicide for control 
of weeds in 
landscape) Mixes 
with glyophosate 
(granular) 

$                            
105.000 

$                          
2,625.00 

$                            
105.000 

$                          
2,625.00 5 lb   

2500 Lb 

13-0-5 Fertilizer with 
.15 dimension 
herbicide (crabgrass 
control) (granular) 
50 lb. Bags, 
Greenyard Crabgrass 
Preventer or 
approved equal. 

$                                
0.373 

$                              
932.50 

$                                
0.373 

$                              
932.50 50 lb   

  Lb 

High quality mix of 
the following turf 
grass see: 50% 
Kentucky blues (2), 
25% Creeping red 
fescue(1), 25% 
Perennial rye (1) 

$                                       
- 

 

$                                       
- 

$                                       
- NA 50 lb bag 

  Gal 

Glyophosate 
herbicide (labeled 
for landscape and 
right of use) 

$                              
12.800 

 

$                              
12.800 

$                                       
- 2.5 gl   

  Lb 

Criterion 0.5 Grub 
Control (Granular in 
bags) 

$                                
0.690 

 

$                                
0.690 

$                                       
- 30 lb bag   
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Quantity Unit Description 
Price/Unit/ 
Delivered 

Total 
Price/ 

Delivered 
Price/Unit/ 

FOB 
Total 

Price/FOB 
Container 

size: 
Notes (ie: Delivery Instructions, Specific 

Formulas) 

  Lb 

Sureguard (Pre and 
post emergent 
herbicide for control 
of weeds in 
landscape) Mixes 
with glyophosate 
(granular) 

$                            
105.000 

 

$                            
105.000 

$                                       
- 5 lb   

  Lb 

13-0-5 Fertilizer with 
.15 dimension 
herbicide (crabgrass 
control) (granular) 
50 lb. Bags, 
Greenyard Crabgrass 
Preventer or 
approved equal. 

$                                
0.373 

 

$                                
0.373 

$                                       
- 50 lb   

         

    

$                        
87,045.64 

 

$                        
87,045.64 

   

 

  

Fisher & Son 
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Genesis 
       

        2018-2019 ARMITAGE GOLF COURSE- HAMPDEN TOWNSHIP BID SHEET 
  

02 12 2018 

       
  

HAMPDEN TOWNSHIP-ARMITAGE: 
      

        
Banol 5 5 1 gallon 

 $                
471.38  

 $            
2,356.90  

 $               
471.38  

 $       
2,356.90  

Chipco GT 4 2 2 x 2.5 gal 
 $                
650.24  

 $            
1,300.48  

 $               
650.24  

 $       
1,300.48  

Compass  10 1 10 lb 
 $            
3,931.29  

 $            
3,931.29  

 $           
3,931.29  

 $       
3,931.29  

Daconil Ultrex 5 20 4 x 5 lb 
 $                
280.00  

 $            
5,600.00  

 $               
280.00  

 $       
5,600.00  

Dithane T/O Fungicide 32 8 4 x 12 lb 
 $                
210.00  

 $            
1,680.00  

 $               
210.00  

 $       
1,680.00  

Emerald Fungide 1 1 10 x 0.49 cs 
 $            
1,568.00  

 $            
1,568.00  

 $           
1,568.00  

 $       
1,568.00  

Enclave Fungicide 20 4 2 x 2.5 gal 
 $                
501.75  

 $            
2,007.00  

 $               
501.75  

 $       
2,007.00  

Endorse Fungicide 3 1 3 x 11 lb 
 $                
687.00  

 $               
687.00  

 $               
687.00  

 $           
687.00  

Heritage Fungicide 10 10 1 lb 
 $                
317.00  

 $            
3,170.00  

 $               
317.00  

 $       
3,170.00  

Honor Fungicide 12 2 6 x 3 lb cs 
 $            
2,616.12  

 $            
5,232.24  

 $           
2,616.12  

 $       
5,232.24  

Insignia Fungicide 2 1 2 x 2.5 gal 
 $            
5,795.00  

 $            
5,795.00  

 $           
5,795.00  

 $       
5,795.00  

Lexicon 16 4 4 x 21 oz cs 
 $            
1,935.36  

 $            
7,741.44  

 $           
1,935.36  

 $       
7,741.44  

Medallion Fungicide 1 1 16 x 5 oz cs 
   

  
8 10 oz 

 $                
149.60  

 $            
1,196.80  

 $               
149.60  

 $       
1,196.80  
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Oreon Fungicide 6 3 No Bid 
    

Secure Fungicide 6 3 2 x 2.5 gal 
 $            
2,940.00  

 $            
8,820.00  

 $           
2,940.00  

 $       
8,820.00  

Spectator T/O Fungicide 5 
 

No Bid 
    

Subdue Maxx 4 2 2 x 1 gal 
 $            
1,040.00  

 $            
2,080.00  

 $           
1,040.00  

 $       
2,080.00  

Tourney Fungicide 2 2 5 lb case 
 $                
692.75  

 $            
1,385.50  

 $               
692.75  

 $       
1,385.50  

Xzemplar 12 
 

11.4 oz 
    

 Xzemplar 
 

1 114 oz 
 $            
1,782.96  

 $            
1,782.96  

 $           
1,782.96  

 $       
1,782.96  

 Xzemplar 
 

2 11.8 oz 
 $                
205.20  

 $               
410.40  

 $               
205.20  

 $           
410.40  

Acclaim X-tra 6 6 1 gal 
 $                
526.00  

 $            
3,156.00  

 $               
526.00  

 $       
3,156.00  

Confront 4 19 1 gal 
 $                
132.00  

 $            
2,508.00  

 $               
132.00  

 $       
2,508.00  

Dimension 2EW 4 2 2 x 2.5 gal 
 $            
1,050.00  

 $            
2,100.00  

 $           
1,050.00  

 $       
2,100.00  

Prosedge 7 9 1.3 oz bottle 
 $                  
72.10  

 $               
648.90  

 $                 
72.10  

 $           
648.90  

Regalkade G Herbicide 12 
 

No Bid 
    

2-4D Amine Herbicide 4 4 2 x 2.5 gal 
 $                  

35.00  
 $               
140.00  

 $                 
35.00  

 $           
140.00  

       
 pg 2/3  

Roundup Pro Maxx Herbicide 4 
 

2.5 gal 
    

  Roundup Pro Maxx 
 

2 2 x 1.67 
 $                
136.32  

 $               
272.64  

 $               
136.32  

 $           
272.64  

Speedzone Herbicide 1 1 2.5 gal 
 $                
204.50  

 $               
204.50  

 $               
204.50  

 $           
204.50  

Snapshot Herbicide 2 2 50 lb 
 $                  
84.03  

 $               
168.06  

 $                 
84.03  

 $           
168.06  

Team 2G Herbicide 90 90 40 lb bag 
 $                  
19.00  

 $            
1,710.00  

 $                 
19.00  

 $       
1,710.00  
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Trimec Bentgrass Herbicide 2 1 2 x 2.5 gal 
 $                
198.00  

 $               
198.00  

 $               
198.00  

 $           
198.00  

Sonar Herbicide 2 2 1 quart 
 $                
985.00  

 $            
1,970.00  

 $               
985.00  

 $       
1,970.00  

Captain Herbicide 2 2 1 gal 
    

  Captan Herbicide 
 

1 2.5 gal 
 $                  
98.92  

 $                  
98.92  

 $                 
98.92  

 $             
98.92  

Acelepryn Insecticide 2 2 64 oz 
 $                
977.50  

 $            
1,955.00  

 $               
977.50  

 $       
1,955.00  

Conserve Insecticide 10 10 1 quart 
 $                
125.00  

 $            
1,250.00  

 $               
125.00  

 $       
1,250.00  

Dursban 4E Insecticide 2 
 

No Bid 
    

Dylox 420 SL Insecticide 4 2 2 x 2.5 gal 
 $                
350.12  

 $               
700.24  

 $               
350.12  

 $           
700.24  

Dylox 6.2 Granular Insecticide 61 61 30 lb 
 $                  
37.67  

 $            
2,297.87  

 $                 
37.67  

 $       
2,297.87  

Merit 75 WSP Insecticide 6 6 4 x 4 x 1.6 
 $                
249.50  

 $            
1,497.00  

 $               
249.50  

 $       
1,497.00  

Permethrin Pro 6 
 

No Bid 
    Provaunt 5 

 
10 0z  

    
  Provaunt 5 10 12 oz 

 $                  
94.50  

 $               
945.00  

 $                 
94.50  

 $           
945.00  

  
1 120 oz 

 $                
852.00  

 $               
852.00  

 $               
852.00  

 $           
852.00  

Ference Insecticide 2 2 96 oz 
 $            
1,668.00  

 $            
3,336.00  

 $           
1,668.00  

 $       
3,336.00  

Nimitz Pro G Nematicide 2 2 40 lb bucket 
 $                
200.00  

 $               
400.00  

 $               
200.00  

 $           
400.00  

Primo Growth Regulator 2 1 2 x 1 gal 
 $                
580.00  

 $               
580.00  

 $               
580.00  

 $           
580.00  

Proxy Growth Regulator 1 1 2 x 2.5 gal 
 $                
189.00  

 $               
189.00  

 $               
189.00  

 $           
189.00  

Trimmit 2 SC Growth 
Regualor 2 1 2 x 2.5 gal 

 $            
2,025.00  

 $            
2,025.00  

 $           
2,025.00  

 $       
2,025.00  
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Cleary Tank Cleaner 24 
 

1 quart 
    

 Tank Cleaner Select 24 24 1 quart 
 $                    

8.90  
 $               
213.60  

 $                   
8.90  

 $           
213.60  

Cleary's Defoamer 3 
 

1gal 
    

  Defoamer Select 
 

12 1 quart 
 $                  

15.30  
 $               
183.60  

 $                 
15.30  

 $           
183.60  

Promark Foam Marker 2 
 

1 gal 
    

  Foam Marker Select 
 

8 1 quart 
 $                  

18.88  
 $               
151.04  

 $                 
18.88  

 $           
151.04  

Duplex Wetting Agent 8 
 

No Bid 
    Lesco Wet Plus Wetting 

Agent 2 
 

No Bid 
    

Ferromec AC 16 8 2 x 2.5 gal 
 $                  
78.94  

 $               
631.52  

 $                 
78.94  

 $           
631.52  

       
 pg 3/3  

18-3-18 Fertilizer w Minors 32 32 50 lb 
 $                  
53.40  

 $            
1,708.80  

 $                 
53.40  

 $       
1,708.80  

  greens grade, SOP 
       

22-6-14 Fertilizer w 60% 240 240 50 lb 
 $                  
25.85  

 $            
6,204.00  

 $                 
25.85  

 $       
6,204.00  

  Nutralene, SOP regular size 
      Nature Safe 8-3-5 green 

grade 44 44 50 lb 
 $                  
35.72  

 $            
1,571.68  

 $                 
35.72  

 $       
1,571.68  

  OR 
       

Healthy Gro 8-3-5 Mini 44 44 50lb 
 $                  
32.46  

 $            
1,428.24  

 $                 
32.46  

 $       
1,428.24  

Plantex 20-20-20 Soluble Fert 88 
 

25 lb 
      UltraSol 20-20-20 Ultra 

Soluble 88 88 25 lb 
 $                  

31.50  
 $            
2,772.00  

 $                 
31.50  

 $       
2,772.00  

Starter Fertilizer 14 
 

50 lb 
     19-25-5 greens grade sop 14 

 
50 lb 

    
  14-28-10 Tee Time 14 14 50 lb 

 $                  
36.50  

 $               
511.00  

 $                 
36.50  

 $           
511.00  
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  50% Mu/Man   100 SGN 
       Alpha Nova 4 

 
No Bid 

    
Granular Dolemitic Lime 12 12 50 lb 

 $                    
5.60  

 $                  
67.20  

 $                   
5.60  

 $             
67.20  

Adams Earth Stimulant 8 
 

No Bid 
    Phosphite 30, 0-0-27 4 4 No Bid 
    16-2-7 25% SRN, Mag, S, 

Micros 12 
 

No Bid 
    Micro Mix Glucoheptonate  4 

 
No Bid 

      Chelate 
       

Penncross Creeping Bentgrass 4 4 25 lb 
 $                
199.50  

 $               
798.00  

 $               
199.50  

 $           
798.00  

Penneagle Creeping 
Bentgrass 4 4 25 lb 

 $                
175.00  

 $               
700.00  

 $               
175.00  

 $           
700.00  

Perennial RyeGrass Mix 2 2 50 lb 
 $                  
72.00  

 $               
144.00  

 $                 
72.00  

 $           
144.00  

Blend: 20 20 50 lb 
 $                
112.50  

 $            
2,250.00  

 $               
112.50  

 $       
2,250.00  

50% Bluegrass (2) 
       25% Creeping Red Fescue (1) 

      25% Perennial Ryegrass (1) 
      

Glyophosate Herbicide 15 3 2 x 2.5 gal 
 $                  
77.50  

 $               
232.50  

 $                 
77.50  

 $           
232.50  

Criterion 0.5 Grub Control  2500 84 30 lb bag 
 $                  
22.37  

 $            
1,879.08  

 $                 
22.37  

 $       
1,879.08  

Sureguard Herbicide 25 lb 5 5 lb 
 $                
645.00  

 $            
3,225.00  

 $               
645.00  

 $       
3,225.00  

13-0-5 w 0.15 Dimenson 2500 50 50 lb bags 
 $                  
18.00  

 $               
900.00  

 $                 
18.00  

 $           
900.00  

NOTE: Alternate sizing or product noted in red 
    

   

ARMITAGE GOLF 
COUSE-HAMPDEN 

TOWNSHIP  
 

 $      
111,518.40  

 

 $  
111,518.40  
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SHARE CORP 
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SHARE CORP 
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Ordering Information – Armitage Golf Course 

Crop Production Services 
Philip Easton 
717-490-4632 
Philip.easton@cpsagu.com 

Fisher and Son Company, Inc. 
Thomas Mahute 
717-940-0730 
tmahute@fisherandson.com 

Genesis Turfgrass, Inc. 
Paul Wickey 
717-439-4441 
paul@genesisturfgrassinc.com 
 
Matt Kessler 
443-844-9649 
matt@genesisturfgrassinc.com 

Helena Chemical Company 
Mike Susshine 
484-624-2208 
susshinem@helenachemical.com 

Plant Food Company, Inc. 
Sarah Berezansky 
609-448-0935 
sberezansky@plantfoodco.com 
 
Mike Janzer 
215-280-6252 
mjanzer@plantfoodco.com 

Share Corp. 
Ralph Fluharty 
570-939-2854 
hartys@dejazzd.com 

 


