O’O Capital Region

Council of Governments

2020-21 LINE PAINTING RESULTS

Contract Term — April 1, 2020 to March 31, 2021
RATIFIED 2/17/2020
Red indicates partial bid (vendor did not bid all items as required in municipal request)

Municipality ENNIS FLINT GEMMILL Traffic Lines, Inc.
Annville Township 5, 890.80 10,349.35 No Bid
Carlisle Borough 11,492.10 107,246.00 105,565.00
Carroll Township No Bid 13,193.47 No Bid
Conewago Township No Bid 40,075.20 No Bid
Derry Township No Bid 52,941.37 No Bid
East Hanover Township No Bid 9,860.00 No Bid
East Pennsboro Township No Bid 5,441.00 No Bid
Fairview Township No Bid 39,926.00 No Bid
Hampden 4,226.58 31,744.45 No Bid
Harrisburg City No Bid 2,238.08 No Bid
Londonderry Township No Bid 13,212.00 No Bid
Lower Allen Township 2,552.76 1,255.20 No Bid
Lower Swatara Township 881.50 24,085.00 No Bid
Middle Paxton Township No Bid 18,030.00 No Bid
North Middleton Township No Bid 18,360.00 No Bid
Silver Spring Township 2,496.50 8,969.67 No Bid
Swatara Township No Bid 9,914.00 No Bid
Upper Allen Township 6,220.74 28,838.00 No Bid
West Hanover Township No Bid 39,897.37 No Bid

Ennis-Flint - Carlisle: Bid does not include items 1-12. Bid is only for items 13-18 Item 16: Price per linear foot given as
requested. Product #8231002 sold 15 linear feet per pack. tem 17: Price each as requested. Product #8330247L sol in pack of 2.
Line item 18: price each given as requested. Product #8330248 sold in pack of 2. Paint note: minimum purchase quantity is 1
pallet (32 pails) - may be mixed colors.

Ennis-Flint - Hampden: Bid does not include items 1-6. Bid is only for items 7-11. Item 7: Price each given as requested. Product
#8330247L sold 2 per pack. Item 8: Price each given as requested. Product #8330247R sold 2 per pack. Item 10: Price per linear
foot given as requested. Product #8432061 sold 60 linear feet per pack. Line Item 11: Price each linear foot given as requested.
Product #8430566 sold 15 linear feet per pack.

Ennis-Flint - Lower Allen Township: Items 1 & @: Price each given as requested. Product #8330247LR sold 2 per pack. Item 3
Price per linear foot given as requested. Product #8432061 sold 60 linear feet per pack. Line Item 41: Price each linear foot
given as requested. Product #8430566 sold 14 linear feet per pack.

Ennis-Flint - Lower Swatara Township: Bid does not include items 1-5. Bid is only for Items 6-8.

Ennis-Flint - Silver Spring Township: Bid does not include items 1-8. Bid is only for Items 9-12. Item 12: Price per each given as
requested. Product is sold 30 linear feet packs.

Ennis-Flint - Upper Allen Township: Bid does not include items 1,2. Items 8-10 are duplicate items and are not bid per Upper
Allen Township. Bid is only for Items 3-7 and 11. Items 3 & 4: Price each given as requested. Product #83304247(L)(R) sold 2
per pack. Item 5: Price each given as requested. Product #8432061 sold 60 linear feet per pack. Item 7: Price each given as
requested. Product #8330248 sold per pack of 2.

Gemmill: Preformed thermoplastic must be purchased by the pack, packs cannot be split as per the manufacturer. Performed
thermoplastic pack prices include delivery.

Gemmill: Silver Spring Township: Item 5 quantity changed from 12,000 to 1,200 LF PK of Thermoplastic per Corey Stazewski by
phone on 1/28/20. Item 10: quantity changed from 8,000 to 800 LF PK of Thermoplastic per Corey Stazewski by phone on
1/28/20.
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Vendor Information

Ennis-Flint, Inc.
4161 Piedmont Parkway, Ste 370
Greensboro, NC 27410

Ordering:
Louisa Wood, Contract
Specialist
336-308-3776
Iwood@ennisflint.com

Terry Flaherty, Regional
Sales Manager
724-880-6314
tflaherty@ennisflint.com

D.E. Gemmill, Inc.
10174 Chapel Church Road
Red Lion, PA 17356

Ordering:
Dave Gemmill
717-755-9794
dave@degemmill.com or
joanne@degemmill.com

Traffic Lines, Inc.
5100 Asbury Road
Farmingdale, NJ 07727

Ordering:
Gene Boyle
732-919-3100
genetrafficlines@gmail.com
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