



**2026-27 LANDSCAPE PARK & GOLF COURSE MATERIALS,
CHEMICALS & SERVICES - **RATIFIED****
Contract Term – April 1, 2026 to March 31, 2027

ORANGE=Successful Bidder

Only Vendors who bid on item are listed. Bids are total (not unit).

LANDSCAPE MATERIALS

PLAYGROUND COVER- ASTM F1292, F1951, F1487 CERTIFIED			Genesis		River Valley		SHILOH	
			FOB	DEL	FOB	DEL	FOB	DEL
100	CY	Camp Hill Borough	3043	3363	2766	2500	3495	4000
100	CY	Carroll Township	3043	3342	2766	2900	3495	4000
50	CY	East Hanover Township	1522	1792	1383	1610	1800	2500
1000	CY	East Pennsboro Township	30426	33976	27660	28400	34950	40000
100	CY	Fairview Township	3043	3398	2760	2800	3495	4000
200	CY	Hampden Township	6086	6796	5532	5680	6990	8000
300	CY	Highspire Borough	9128	9983	8298	8270	10485	12000
60	CY	Hummelstown Borough	1826	2111	1659.60	1760	2160	3000
50	CY	Lemoyne Borough	1522	1842	1383	1660	1800	2500
100	CY	Lower Paxton Township	3043	3363	2766	2800	3495	4000
200	CY	Middletown Borough	6086	6656	5532	5515	6990	8000
100	CY	New Cumberland Borough	3043	3363	2766	2800	3495	4000
300	CY	Silver Spring Township	9128	10193	8298	8520	10485	12000

DIAMOND TEX (PREMIUM) INFIELD MIX (Professional Grade) OR EQUIVALENT			Genesis		SHILOH	
			FOB	DEL	FOB	DEL
50	Ton	Camp Hill Borough	3500	4375	3500	4000
20	Ton	Conewago Township – Dauphin County	1400	1673	1440	1640
100	Ton	East Pennsboro Township	7000	8835	6900	7900
22	Ton	Hampden Township	1540	1933	1562	1782
40	Ton	Lower Allen Township	2800	3506	2800	3200
20	Ton	Lower Paxton Township	1400	1740	1440	1640
45	Ton	Lower Swatara Township	3150	3812	3525	3975
50	Ton	Middle Paxton Township	3500	4488	3500	4000

DIAMOND TEX (ORIGINAL) INFIELD MIX			Genesis		SHILOH	
			FOB	DEL	FOB	DEL
20	Ton	Carroll Township	1100	1488	1250	1600
40	Ton	East Hanover Township	2200	2886	2480	2880
100	Ton	East Pennsboro Township	5500	7335	6200	7200
60	Ton	Fairview Township	3300	4287	3720	4320
150	Ton	Middletown Borough	8250	10478	9300	10800
125	Ton	Silver Spring Township	6875	9282	7750	9000
160	Ton	Swatara Township	8800	11232	9920	11520

FIBAR Playground Mulch			River Valley		SHILOH	
			FOB	DEL	FOB	DEL
50	CY	Dillsburg Borough	1383	1610	2000	2250
500	CY	Lower Allen Township	13830	13990	17475	20000
500	CY	Lower Paxton Township	13830	13905	17475	20000
40	CY	Swatara Township	1106.40	1335	2000	2250

RUBBERIZED PLAYGROUND MULCH			Vendor	
			FOB	DEL
50	CY	Lower Allen Township	No Bid	No Bid

SANDBOX SAND – WHITE			SHILOH	
			FOB	DEL
10	Ton	Lemoyne Borough	800	1300
60	Ton	Middletown Borough	3600	4800

SIFTED TOP SOIL			SHILOH	
			FOB	DEL
50	Ton	Lower Allen Township	1500	2400
8	Ton	Lower Swatara Township	250	550
100	Ton	Middletown Borough	3000	4800
50	Ton	Swatara Township	1500	2400

TRIPLE GROUND HARDWOOD MULCH - BLACK			Vendor	
			FOB	DEL
100	CY	Lower Allen Township	No Bid	No Bid

WHITE VOLLEYBALL COURT SAND			Genesis		SHILOH	
			FOB	DEL	FOB	DEL
60	Ton	East Pennsboro Township	3840	5520	3800	4900
40	Ton	Lower Allen Township	2560	3680	1400	2200
600	Ton	Lower Paxton Township	38400	55200	27000	33000

LANDSCAPE CHEMICALS

13-0-5 FERTILIZER WITH .15 DIMENSION HERBICIDE (crabgrass control) (granular), 50 lb bags, Greenyard Crabgrass Preventer or approved equal			Genesis		SiteOne	
			FOB	DEL	FOB	DEL
1000	Lb	Middletown Borough	445	445	586.20	586.20

Genesis: GM 13-0-5-25%XCU .15% Dimension

Site One: #702015 Lesco Dimension 0-15% 13-05-5 50 lb

CONFRONT – Broad Leaf Weed Killer			Genesis		SiteOne	
			FOB	DEL	FOB	DEL
10	Gal	Hampden Township	1650	1650	1624.20	1624.20
10	Gal	Middletown Borough				

DIMENSION 2EW - Herbicide			Genesis		SiteOne	
			FOB	DEL	FOB	DEL
20	Gal	Fairview Township	5149.04	5149.04	5149.04	5149.04

ELEMENT 3A – Broad Leaf and Stump Control for Right of Way			Genesis	
			FOB	DEL
25	Gal	Lower Swatara Township	1150	1150
10	Gal	Middletown Borough	460	460

Genesis: Alternate for Element 3A Broad Leaf and Stump Control is Triclopyr 3A.

GLYOPHOSATE HERBICIDE (LABELED FOR LANDSCAPE AND RIGHT OF USE)			Genesis		SiteOne	
			FOB	DEL	FOB	DEL
60	Gal	East Pennsboro Township	1180	1180	1473.12	1473.12
60	Gal	Fairview Township	1180	1180	1473.12	1473.12
10	Gal	Hampden Township	208	208	245.52	245.52
10	Gal	Highspire Borough	208	208	245.52	245.52
55	Gal	Middletown Borough	1144	1144	1350.36	1350.36

OUST XP - Herbicide			Genesis		SiteOne	
			FOB	DEL	FOB	DEL
6	Lb	Fairview Township	270	270	470.34	470.34

QUICKSILVER BROADLEAF HERBICIDE (Liquid for Turf Use)			Genesis	
			FOB	DEL
25	Gal	Lower Swatara Township	4500	4500
5	Gal	Middletown Borough	900	900

Genesis: Quicksilver is sold in 8 oz bottles. Bid reflects cost for conversion to gal units.

SUREGUARD (Pre and post emergent herbicide for control of weeds in landscape) Mixes with glyphosate (granular)			Genesis		SiteOne	
			FOB	DEL	FOB	DEL
3	Lb	Fairview Township	117	117	124.80	124.80
10	Lb	Hampden Township	375	375	389.54	389.54

Site One: #297987 Flumioxazin; Fairview: 57WDG Select 1 lb; Hampden: #298182 Flumioxazin

Genesis: SureGuard Pre and post emergent herbicide: Flumioxazin 51 WDG Select is granular; Bid is 5lb containers.

TRIMEC ENCORE BROADLEAF HERBICIDE (Liquid for Turf Use)			Genesis		SiteOne*	
			FOB	DEL	FOB	DEL
10	Gal	Hampden Township	780	780	28287.77	28287.77
25	Gal	Lower Swatara Township	1950	1950	812.20	812.20
5	Gal	Middletown Borough	390	390	162.44	162.44

Site One bid disqualified due to lack of clarification from Site One despite numerous attempts.

SiteOne: Hampden: #9921016 Trimec 992 55 gal; Lower Swatara: #9921126 Trimec 992 2.5 gal; Middletown: #9921126 Trimec 992 2.5 Gal

TRIPLET SF 3-WAY BROADLEAF HERBICIDE (Liquid for Turf Use)			Genesis		SiteOne	
			FOB	DEL	FOB	DEL
10	Gal	Hampden Township	200	200	300.68	300.68
25	Gal	Lower Swatara Township	650	650	751.70	751.70
5	Gal	Middletown Borough	130	130	150.34	150.34

SiteOne: #10446225; Hampden: Lesco Three Way 2.5 Gal

Genesis: AT Threesome is Private Label Triplet SF 3-way

LANDSCAPE CHEMICALS - ARMITAGE GOLF COURSE

Quantity	Unit	Description	Genesis	
			FOB	Del
25	Ton	WET/Golf Course Greens, Topdressing, 100% Sand. Meets US Golf Assoc. Greens Topdressing specs for size and shape. <i>Substitute for a similar product OK. Required SGN 150.</i>	688	1613
25	Ton	Dry/Sterilized Greens Top Dressing, 100% Sand. Meets US Golf Assoc. Greens Topdressing specs for size and shape.	1825	2131
200	Ton	Bunker Sand 1040 White	6900	14300
2000	Lb	Country Club 25-0-5 51% MESA 100% EXPO with .067% Acelepryn + .167% Dimension SGN 150	3220	3220
100	Gal	Wetting Agent Lesco Flo Ultra or Cascade Similar Product	7650	7650

Genesis: Fertilizer w/Acelepryn and Dimension: Lebanon 25-0-51% Mesa, .067% Acel,.167% Dimension SGN 150.

Genesis: Lesco Flow Wetting agent: Conduct 90 in 2.5 gallon jug.

Vendor Information

Genesis Turfgrass, Inc. 137 Commerce Drive Glen Rock, PA 17327 Ordering: Don Dodson 717-586-9064 ddodson@genesisdist.com Jordan Hochberg 443-844-7100 jhochberg@genesisdist.com	River Valley Landscapes 1178 Nursery Road Wrightsville, PA 17368 JR Kriner 717-332-4148 jr@rivervalleylandscapes.com Ordering: JR Kriner 717-332-4148 jr@rivervalleylandscapes.com	Shiloh Paving & Excavating 300 Cloverleaf Road York, PA 17406 Matthew P Harlacher 717-577-5715 Mharlacher@shilohpaving.com Ordering: Matthew P Harlacher 717-577-5715 Mharlacher@shilohpaving.com
SiteOne Landscape Supply 24500 Center Ridge Road Ste 350 Westlake, OH 44145 Rosalin Santiago 216-706-9250 x2 bids@siteone.com Ordering: Monique Potts 216-706-9250 x2 bids@siteone.com		