



2026-27 CHEMICALS WASTE WATER & POOL RESULTS - RATIFIED
Contract Term – April 1, 2026 to March 31, 2027

Grey=No Bid

Orange=Successful Bidder

Pricing is unit/not total; all pricing is for delivery (no FOB). Only vendors who bid on product are shown.

Calcium Nitrate TOTAL 17,300			Evoqua
7,300	GAL	Hampden Township	3.05
10,000	GAL	Silver Spring Township Authority 3.5lb Oz/Gallon; S.G.: 1.42; 4 deliveries of 2500 gallons; Walden & Avalon Pump Stations	

Calcium Quik Lime TOTAL 182			Carmeuse
182	TON	Hampden Township	590.00

Chlorine Gas 150-lb cylinder TOTAL 52			Univar
20	CYL	Annville Township	964.00
32	CYL	Mechanicsburg WWTP	

Chlorine Gas 1-Ton Cylinder TOTAL 8			Kuehne	Univar
8	CYL	East Pennsboro Township	5,000.00	2,965.00

Ferric Sulfate 10% TOTAL 20,000			Kemira
20,000	GAL	Annville Township	1.87

Kemira: PIX-308

Ferrous Sulfate TOTAL 126,000			Evoqua	Pencco
20,000	GAL	Annville Township	1.83	1.63
5,000	GAL	Camp Hill Borough	1.75	1.63
73,000	GAL	Hampden Township	1.73	1.63
28,000	GAL	Newberry Township Sewer Department (<i>ODOPHOS – Deliveries 4,000 gallons each</i>)	1.68	1.54

Liquid Aluminum Sulfate TOTAL 166,000			USALCO
50,000	GAL	East Pennsboro Township	1.4835
55,000	GAL	Hampden Township	
37,000	GAL	Mechanicsburg WWTP	
24,000	GAL	Silver Spring Township Authority (<i>Six (6) 4,000 Gallon deliveries</i>)	

Liquid Magnesium Hydroxide TOTAL 14,275			Univar
14,000	GAL	Hampden Township	5.2529
275	GAL	Mechanicsburg WWTP	6.2861

Methanol TOTAL 28,000			Vendor
20,000	GAL	Annville Township	NO BID
8,000	GAL	Mechanicsburg WWTP	

Neo Water FX-300 TOTAL 8,000			Vendor
8,000	GAL	Highspire Borough	NO BID

Pollu-Tech CL-241 Cationic TOTAL 24			Pollu-Tech
24	55-GAL DRUM	Newberry Township Sewer Department (<i>4 drums per delivery with liftgate</i>)	20,952

Sodium Hypochlorite TOTAL 7,641			Vendor
7,641	GAL	Hampden Township POOL	NO BID

Vendor Contact Information

Carmeuse - O-N Minerals (Chemstone Company) 11 Stanwix Street, 21st Floor Pittsburgh, PA 15222 Attn: Inside Sales Dana Brooks 866-780-0974 salesinquiries@carmeuse.com Ordering: Supply Planning Coordinator 800-445-3930 salesadminrequests@carmeuse.com	Evoqua Water Technologies, LLC 2650 Tallevast Road Sarasota, FL 34243 David L. Morano 941-359-7940 utilityservicesinbox@xylem.com Ordering: Jessie Harrison 941-359-7914 Jessie.harrison@xylem.com Rhonda Everingham 601-808-0824 rhonda.everingham@xylem.com	Kemira Water Solutions, Inc. Christina Imbrogno 4321 W. 6th Street Lawrence KS 66049 Christina M. Imbrogno 785-842-7424 Kwsna.bids@kemira.com Ordering: Customer Service 800-927-3950 IW-customerservice@kemira.com
Kuehne Chemical Co., Inc. 86 N. Hackensack Avenue Kearny, NJ 07032 Jaclyn Diconstanzi 973-589-0700 bids@kuehnecompany.com Ordering: Kimberly Bustamante/Andrea Rodriguez 973-589-0700 orders@kuehnecompany.com	Pencco, Inc. PO Box 600 San Felipe TX 77473 Jennifer Guajardo 979-885-0005 jguajardo@pencco.com Ordering: Diana Palamino 979-885-0005 orders@pencco.com	Pollu-Tech, Inc. 155 W Creek Rd, PO Box 69 Benton, PA 17814 Evan Thursby 814-375-5214 info@pollu-tech.com Ordering: Kaitlyn/Evan Thursby 814-375-5214 info@pollu-tech.com

...More vendors on next page

Univar Solutions USA LLC. 68 Shelbourne Road Richboro, PA 18954 Victoria Meakim 267-397-4074 Victoria.meakim@univarsolutions.com Mail Documents to: 68 Shelbourne Road, Richboro, PA 18954 Ordering: Victoria Bozena 877-561-6990 or 215-337-5448 custsolnortheast@univarsolutions.com	Usalco LLC 2601 Cannery Avenue Baltimore, MD 21226 Bret McCoy 800-453-2586 bids@usalco.com Ordering: Order Entry Team 800-453-2586 orders@usalco.com <i>(please indicate product/deliver address/volume and PO#)</i>
--	---